






Introduction 
Sustainable Timber Tasmania is a Government Business Enterprise that manages all 
Permanent Timber Production Zone (PTPZ) land in Tasmania. It is also required under 
legislation to undertake forest operations for the production and sale of forest products from 
these forests. Sustainable Timber Tasmania manages Tasmania's public production forests 
responsibly and professionally for the long term, and recognises that there are multiple uses 
of the forest. 

Many beekeepers in Tasmania access hive sites on land managed by Sustainable Timber 
Tasmania. Many hive sites on PTPZ land are located near forests rich in leatherwood 
(Eucryphia lucida), which provides a source of nectar unique to Tasmania that is used to 
produce a significant proportion of Tasmania's honey. Other important sources of nectar 
include various eucalypts, 'manuka' (Leptospermum species), and understorey species. 

Sustainable Timber Tasmania acknowledges the contribution of the apiary industry to the 
Tasmanian economy through the sale of honey and associated products and the provision of 
pollination services to plant-based industries. Sustainable Timber Tasmania recognises that 
the provision of these pollination services is highly reliant upon the seasonal availability of 
forest based nectar sources. 

This guideline replaces the 2000 Community Forest Agreement between Sustainable Timber 
Tasmania and the Tasmanian Beekeepers Association Inc and the 2000 guideline, known as 
the Guidelines for Beekeeping on State Forest. 

This guideline should be read in conjunction with the Tasmanian Apiary Management 
Guidelines for Public Land that sets out the allocation and management of apiary sites on 
public land. 

This guideline has been endorsed by the Tasmanian Beekeepers Association Inc in 
May 2019. 

Purpose 
The purpose of these guidelines is to provide principles that assist planners in the 
management of the apiary values across Tasmania's production forest landscapes. 

Apiary Value Principles 
Sustainable Timber Tasmania recognises commercial nectar resources as a special value 
that needs consideration and management when conducting harvesting, regeneration and 
fuel reduction operations. 

It is the goal of the apiary industry to exclude all commercial nectar resources from impact by 
forestry operations. The apiary industry acknowledges that not all of the commercial nectar 
resource on PTPZ land can be retained. 

Policy 

In the context of the commercial nectar resource, and in particular the commercial 
leatherwood resource, two policy positions of Sustainable Timber Tasmania are relevant. 

• Coupes Containing Old Growth (defined as coupes with greater than 25% by area of
mapped old growth forest) will only be harvested by variable retention methods.
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